Bid Tabulation

ITB 26 - 19R "LAB SUPPLIES, CGMHS STOREROOM"

Latoria Kenniebrew, Buyer
kenniebrewl@jccal.org

MEDLINE NEGOTIATED

GRAND TOTAL

$

5,744.90000

PIPETTES, CAPILLARY HEPARINIZED 200/VIAL, 5 VIALS PER PACK, 75MM DIAMETER,
MYLAR WRAPPED, CARDINAL # P5066-16 OR APPROVED EQUAL

1 BRAND/STK NO DLS51613 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.03230( $ 32.34000

PIPETTES, CAPILLARY PLAIN, 200/VIAL,
WRAPPED, CARDINAL #P5066-15 OR APPROVED EQUAL

5 VIALS PER PACK, 75MM DIAMETER, MYLAR

2 BRAND/STK NO DLS51602 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.02970 $ 29.67000

TUBES, DISPOSABLE GLASS 12 X 75MM 1000/CS FISHER #1496126 FOR CELL WASHER
BLOOD BANK APPLICATION OR APPROVED EQUAL

3 BRAND/STK NO MLAB12X75B MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.03300 | $ 33.00000

TUBES, GLASS DISPOSABLE 16 X 100MM
#11290-6 OR APPROVED EQUAL

1000/CS FISHER #1496129 OR CARDINAL

4 BRAND/STK NO DLS1512 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.07640 | $ 76.36000
CONTAINER, SPUTUM, STERILE, AFB COLLECTING SYSTEM, INDIVIDUALLY

WRAPPED, 72 PIECES PER CASE FALCON #C8848 OR APPROVED EQUAL

5 BRAND/STK NO B-D290020 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 72 EA/IBX
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 4.00290 | $ 288.21000

86A OR APPROVED EQUAL

SPECIMEN CONTAINER WITH LID, 86 OZ

. DISPOSABLE, 25/CASE, CARDINAL #C8842-

6 BRAND/STK NO DLS271086W GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 25 EAICS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 1.44560 | $ 36.14000

OR APPROVED EQUAL

SPECIMEN CONTAINER, DISPOSABLE STERILE, 4 OZ., 100/CASE CARDINAL #C8827-4

7 BRAND/STK NO DYND30389 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 100 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.41000 | $ 41.00000

SPECIMEN CONTAINER WITH LID, 163 OZ, 10/CS (8-3/4 X 7) CARDINAL #C8842-172A
FISHER #02544210A OR APPROVED EQUAL

8 BRAND/STK NO DYND30331 MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 100 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.44000 | $ 44.00000

TUBE, VACUTAINER PLUS, 13 X 75-3 M
CARDINAL #B2953-8 OR APPROVED EQUAL

L DRAW - LAVENDER, BD #367856 PLASTIC,

9 BRAND/STK NO B-D367856 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.16220| $ 162.16000
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MEDLINE NEGOTIATED

GRAND TOTAL

$

5,744.90000

TUBE, VACUTAINER PLUS 13 X 100 6 ML
52 OR APPROVED EQUAL

DRAW - GRAY BD #367922 CARDINAL #B2953-

10 BRAND/STK NO B-D367925 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.32970| $ 329.68000
VACUTAINER SERUM SEPARATION TUBE 10 ML., GOLD STOPPER, BD367986, 500/PKG,
500/CASE OR APPROVED EQUAL

11 BRAND/STK NO B-D367986 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.44560 | $ 445.58000
VACUTAINER TUBE, RED, 7 ML., PLAIN 100/PKG. — BD #367815, 1000/CASE #B2982-52 OR
APPROVED EQUAL

12 BRAND/STK NO B-D367815 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.23140| $ 231.35000
CONTAINER, SPUTUM, STERILE, AFB COLLECTING SYSTEM, INDIVIDUALLY
WRAPPED, 72 PIECES PER CASE FALCON #C8848 OR APPROVED EQUAL

13 BRAND/STK NO B-D290020 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 72 EA/BX
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 4.00290 | $ 288.21000
SLIDE MAILER HOLDS 2 EACH 3 X 1 MICRO SLIDES 36/PK FISHER #1258716, BD #423787
CARDINAL # 3787 OR APPROVED EQUAL

14 BRAND/STK NO DLS513002 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.17000 | $ 170.00000
BUTTERFLY 21 X % LUER BD 367281 OR APPROVED EQUAL

15 BRAND/STK NO DYNDTNBCS21G MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 200 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.55000 | $ 110.00000
BUTTERFLY 23 X% LUER BD 367283 OR APPROVED EQUAL

16 BRAND/STK NO DYNDTNBCS23G MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 200 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.55000 | $ 110.00000
TUBE, VACUTAINER PST GEL & LITHIUM HEPARIN, 3.5 ML, 13 X 100MM, BD #367961
OR APPROVED EQUAL

17 BRAND/STK NO B-D367961 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.38300 | $ 383.04000
TUBE, VACUTAINER PPT, K2E 9.0 MG, PLASMA PREPARATION TUBE, 5.0 ML, 13 X
100MM, BD 362788 OR APPROVED EQUAL

18 BRAND/STK NO B-D362788 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 1.69800| $ 1,697.99000
NEEDLE, MULTI-SAMPLE, 21 GA X 1”7, MONOJECT #216033 OR APPROVED EQUAL

19 BRAND/STK NO SYR100215 MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.02570 | $ 25.68000
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MEDLINE NEGOTIATED

GRAND TOTAL $ 5,744.90000

TUBE, SERUM SEPARATOR, MICROTAINER AMBER, BD #365959 OR APPROVED
EQUAL

20 BRAND/STK NO B-D365978 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 200 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.81920| $ 163.84000
TUBE, WITH K2E, CAPILLARY BLOOD COLLECTION, MICROTAINER, PINK TOP, BD
#36597 OR APPROVED EQUAL

21 BRAND/STK NO I
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH |
NALGENE WIDE-MOUTH HPDE BOTTLE, 2 OZ (60 ML); FISHER SCIENTIFIC; CAT # 02-893
4A; THERMOFISHER #2103-0002 OR APPROVED EQUAL

29 BRAND/STK NO DLS7020060 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 72 EAICS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 1.06420 [ $ 76.62000
WIDE MOUTH POLYPROPYLENE JARS; 32 OZ; FISHER SCIENTIFIC; CAT #02-891-F; 24
JARS PER CASE OR APPROVED EQUAL

23 BRAND/STK NO QOR252842 QORPAK
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 16 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 9.69060 | $ 155.05000
FIVE SLIDE MAILER; HOLDS FIVE STANDARD GLASS SLIDES (3"X1"); CONSTRUCTED
OF EXTRA-STRONG CLEAR POLYPROPYLENE; 25 PER PACK; CAT# HS15986, FISHER
SCIENTIFIC OR APPROVED EQUAL

24 BRAND/STK NO MLAB5001005 MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/KAR
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.08300 | $ 83.00000
RED TOP TUBES-VACUTAINER PLAIN RED SIL; 100 EA/PK; 10 PACK/CASE; CAT # 02-685-
A; ORDER 2 CASES (20 PACKS); FISHER HEALTH OR APPROVED EQUAL

25
BRAND/STK NO I
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH |
MULTIPLE REAGENT STRIPS, CHEMSTRIP 10 100/BTL #417145-BC, #U2235-2 OR
APPROVED EQUAL

26 BRAND/STK NO '
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH |
CONTAINER, SPECIMEN, NON-STERILE 6 OZ. WITH PAPER LID - 500/CASE MFG.
PREMIUM PLASTIC - #PP4646 OR APPROVED EQUAL

27 BRAND/STK NO DYND30100 MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 500 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.08440 | $ 42.18000
SPECIMEN CONTAINER, 32 OZ., DISPOSABLE, 100/CASE, CARDINAL #C8842-32A OR
APPROVED EQUAL

28 BRAND/STK NO DYND34265 MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 100 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.26880 | $ 26.88000
CONTAINER-SPECIMEN - 8 OZ NON STERILE, CARDINAL #C8842-8A OR APPROVED
EQUAL

29 BRAND/STK NO '

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH
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MEDLINE NEGOTIATED

GRAND TOTAL

$ 5,744.90000

MICROSCOPE SLIDES, PRECLEANED, ONE END FROSTED ERIC ONLY NO SUB. 1” X 3”,
10 GROS/1CASE #1255034 CARDINAL #M6147 OR APPROVED EQUAL

30 BRAND/STK NO

MLABSLIDEF MEDLINE

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

EACH 1440 EAICS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

$ 0.04930| $ 71.00000

APPROVED EQUAL

STERILE SPECIMEN CONTAINER (INSIDE/OUT), 4 OZ, CARDINAL #30331 OR

31 BRAND/STK NO DYND30331 MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 100 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.44000| $ 44.00000
CONTAINER 24HR GRADUATED URINE-GUARD FISHER #0254032, #U3010-1 OR
APPROVED EQUAL

32 BRAND/STK NO DYND80024 MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 20 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 1.21650| $ 24.33000

CAPILLARY WHOLE BLOOD COLLECTOR TUBE-MICRO BEADLESS W/DIPOT
MONOJECT# 008026 OR BD #36-5972 NEW #81-008026 OR APPROVED EQUAL

33 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

APPROVED EQUAL

TUBES, CENTRIFUGE, 15 ML., CONICAL - GRADUATED, 500/CASE CARDINAL #8514 OR

34 BRAND/STK NO DLS6260 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1000 EA/CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 0.04600| $ 46.00000

CULTURETTE COLLECTION AND TRANSPORT SYSTEM - BBL #260210 100/PK, OR
CARDINAL #C8522-11, 200/CASE, 50/PACK, 4 PACKS PER CASE OR APPROVED EQUAL

3 BRAND/STK NO B-D220130 BD
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 50 EA/BX
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 2.27520| $ 113.76000
WHATMAN BLOODSTAIN CARDS, FOR THE COLLECTION AND TRANSPORT OF BLOOD
AND BODY FLUIDS, CAT # 09-923-351, 100 CARDS PER PACK, FISHER SCIENTIFIC OR
APPROVED EQUAL

3 BRAND/STK NO GEHWB100014 WHATMAN
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 100 EA/PAK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 257210| $ 257.21000

#11290-6 OR APPROVED EQUAL

TUBES, GLASS DISPOSABLE 16 X 100MM

1000/CS FISHER #1496129 OR CARDINAL

37 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

NEEDLE, MULTI-SAMPLE, 21 GA X 1”7, MONOJECT #216033 OR APPROVED EQUAL

38 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH
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MEDLINE NEGOTIATED

GRAND TOTAL $ 5,744.90000

NALGENE WIDE-MOUTH HPDE BOTTLE, 2 OZ (60 ML); FISHER SCIENTIFIC; CAT # 02-893
4A; THERMOFISHER #2103-0002 OR APPROVED EQUAL

39 BRAND/STK NO DLS7020060 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC, INC.
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 72 EAICS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 1.06420] $ 76.62000
RED TOP TUBES-VACUTAINER PLAIN RED SIL; 100 EA/PK; 10 PACK/CASE; CAT # 02-685-
A; ORDER 2 CASES (20 PACKS); FISHER HEALTH OR APPROVED EQUAL

40
BRAND/STK NO I
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH |
MULTIPLE REAGENT STRIPS, ROCHE DIAGNOSTIC 11895362, CHEMSTRIP 10 100/BTL
#417145. NO SUBSTITUTIONS.

41 BRAND/STK NO MPHUA10SG MEDLINE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER EACH 1BT/BOT
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 30.00000 | $ 30.00000
MICROSCOPE SLIDES, PRECLEANED, ONE END FROSTED ERIC ONLY NO SUB. 1” X 3,
10 GROS/1CASE #1255034 CARDINAL #M6147 OR APPROVED EQUAL

42 BRAND/STK NO I
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH |

Delivery guaranteed not later than _3 ARO__ days after order date.

MAXIMUM DISCOUNT

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd year _0_ %.
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd year _0_ %.

REQUIRED FORMS

Notification of Intent to Respond YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES
EEOC Form YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES
Debarment Statement YES
Signature Page YES
Price Sheet YES

CONTACT INFORMATION

MEDLINE

Three Lakes Drive, Northfiled, IL 60093 | Chris Powers P: 1.800.636.8150

E: govbids@medline.com
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